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On September 21, 2023 the current leader of Yad Vashem, Dani Dayan, an Argentina-born 
high-tech entrepreneur and university lecturer, finally spoke for the first time in front of a 
free Lithuanian Parliament in a 15-minute speech https://youtu.be/3OskH9a6FgY?
si=853QYYCf5_eMcG6N the truth about how Lithuania came to have a 95% murder rate 
since Hitler’s Operation Barbarossa has a characteristic of solitude because there were 
nowhere so many "willing enforcers". Official Lithuania denies any obligation to 
individually return stolen property (to surviving Jews or their heirs). He claims not to have 
been a (co-offender) but solely a victim (there was a "genocide" of Lithuania by the USSR, 
although Lithuanian remained the official language (Russian was abolished immediately 
after independence) and 95% of all Lithuanians were murdered either, rather the number 
of Lithuanians was never greater than in Soviet times).

Official Lithuania grants orders to those who praise it for its handling of the past, and 
expects Jews gratitude for small lump sum payments to an organization 
https://www.lzb.lt/en led by a (came to power through dubious manipulations) Faina 
Kukliansky https://defendinghistory.com/category/kukliansky-faina This lady discriminates 
against truth-tellers like Dovid Katz (and defendinghistory.com ) and reliably keeps quiet 
when you want to destroy the professional existence of truth-tellers, such as that of the 
honored filmmaker Saulius Berzinis https://www.australianjewishnews.com

Behind the Lithuanian scenes seem Holocaust relatives like Sergej Kanovich 
https://defendinghistory.com/tag/kanovich-sergey who lack sufficient sense of justice and 
handling critics to enjoy state welfare. The official Lithuania does not want to be disturbed 
in its nazi worship, completely with professional destruction of existence of upright truth 
tellers.

You can read and hear the truth for a long time. But in the "Seimas" it has never been as 
clear as on September 21, 2023. Dani Dayan referred to Yitzhak Arad in his speech (whose 
family - like many other Jewish partisans who did not simply want to be killed but resisted 
with guns - is still waiting for a formal excuse for Lithuanian persecution). For the sake of 
future generations, "national heroes" who are honored in the streets and squares, in 
museums and universities of the country should no longer be those who were 
collaborators of the Holocaust in writings and deeds. State-funded museums, commissions 
and institutes in Eastern Europe, however, continue to agree against this simple truth and 
promote double genocide revisionism (see Prague declaration, which counts our former 
federal president Gauck as the signatories). https://defendinghistory.com/prague-
declaration a strange mix of victims and perpetrators turning the history of the Holocaust 
into a huge shambles of false equalities. The speech didn't go unnoticed: 
https://www.thetimes.co.uk/.../yad-vashem-tells...
Dayan literally said: "Lithuania must not only refrain from publicly honoring such 
massacres, but also consistently acknowledge that many of the Lithuanian Jews who were 
massacred in the Holocaust died at the hands of their Lithuanian parents, at the hands of 
her Lithuanian fellow citizens, and that Lithuanians also." were involved in the eradication 
of Jews in neighboring countries. Such recognition is owed to Jewish victims, but also to 
present and future generations of Lithuanians. Forgetfulness is an unacceptable parenting 
option for your youth.
https://youtu.be/3OskH9a6FgY?si=CiIYmxpg9h7xlXF9&t=208
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We should have zero tolerance for Antisemitism, even in this room. This zero tolerance 
policy must also apply to glorifying war criminals who were involved in the murder of Jews. 
Names such as Noreika, Skirpa and Krikštaponis contribute neither to the honor of your 

country, nor to the fact that it meets international standards for an appropriate national 
memorial.

In Lithuanian history, there were actually admirable saviors during the Holocaust. Last year 
here in Vilnius, myself, along with the Prime Minister, awarded several of these heroes and 
heroines through their descendants the title "Rights Among Nations". But in Lithuanian 
history during the Holocaust there were also heinous perpetrators. And of course, lots of 
spectators. They all need to be reminded - accurately, proportionately and in context. “

In doing so, the Chairman of Yad Vashem has taken a major step towards helping his 
institution again as a powerful custodian of the historical truth for which it was created.

Given in the geopolitical context, Dani Dayan’s courageous performance takes on 
additional historical significance, considering that Yad Vashem has been under acute 
pressure from the Israeli Foreign Ministry for many years to help Israeli foreign policy, 
votes in the European Union, NATO, the United Nations and beyond. to win.

But the policy of throwing the truth about the Eastern European Holocaust in order to gain 
votes reached its absurd moral bankruptcy in 2017 when Israel’s first ambassador to 
Lithuania posed with photo of a Holocaust collaborator - the core of modern Israeli 
diplomacy (attempts, same collaborator in New Britain, Connecticut, a On the other hand, 
the city council refused to erect a monument). The said ambassador received a medal in 
return after attending a military school named after another Holocaust collaborator. Hardly 
greater could be the opposition to Israel’s ambassador to Latvia and Lithuania, the late 
Chen Ivri Apter (1958-2012), who was an inspiring example of just doing the right thing.

https://www.yadvashem.org/.../yad-vashem-chairman-address...
 ·  · See original Rate this translation
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